
Genesis 1: 26-27  

Then God said, “Let us make man in our image, after our likeness. And let them have dominion over the 
fish of the sea and over the birds of the heavens and over the livestock and over all the earth and over 
every creeping thing that creeps on the earth.” So, God created man in his own image, in the image of God 
he created him; male and female he created them. 

Psalm 139:13-14  

For you formed my inward parts; you knitted me together in my mother's womb. I praise you, for I am 
fearfully and wonderfully made. Wonderful are your works; my soul knows it very well. 

Genesis 2:15-17  

The Lord God took the man and put him in the garden of Eden to work it and keep it. And the Lord God 
commanded the man, saying, “You may surely eat of every tree of the garden, but of the tree of the 
knowledge of good and evil you shall not eat, for in the day that you eat of it you shall surely die.” 

1 Corinthians 15:20-22 

 But in fact Christ has been raised from the dead, the first fruits of those who have fallen asleep. For as by 
a man came death, by a man has come also the resurrection of the dead.  For as in Adam all die, so also 
in Christ shall all be made alive. 

Ephesians 2: 1-10  

And you were dead in the trespasses and sins 2 in which you once walked, following the course of this 
world, following the prince of the power of the air, the spirit that is now at work in the sons of 
disobedience— 3 among whom we all once lived in the passions of our flesh, carrying out the desires of 
the body and the mind, and were by nature children of wrath, like the rest of mankind. 4 But God, being 
rich in mercy, because of the great love with which he loved us, 5 even when we were dead in our 
trespasses, made us alive together with Christ—by grace you have been saved— 6 and raised us up with 
him and seated us with him in the heavenly places in Christ Jesus, 7 so that in the coming ages he might 
show the immeasurable riches of his grace in kindness toward us in Christ Jesus. 8 For by grace you have 
been saved through faith. And this is not your own doing; it is the gift of God, 9 not a result of works, so 
that no one may boast. 10 For we are his workmanship, created in Christ Jesus for good works, which God 
prepared beforehand, that we should walk in them. 

Romans 5:12-21  

Therefore, just as sin came into the world through one man, and death through sin, and so death spread 
to all men because all sinned— for sin indeed was in the world before the law was given, but sin is not 
counted where there is no law. Yet death reigned from Adam to Moses, even over those whose sinning 
was not like the transgression of Adam, who was a type of the one who was to come. 

But the free gift is not like the trespass. For if many died through one man’s trespass, much more have the 
grace of God and the free gift by the grace of that one man Jesus Christ abounded for many. And the free 
gift is not like the result of that one man’s sin. For the judgment following one trespass brought 
condemnation, but the free gift following many trespasses brought justification. For if, because of one 
man’s trespass, death reigned through that one man, much more will those who receive the abundance 
of grace and the free gift of righteousness reign in life through the one man Jesus Christ. 



Therefore, as one trespass led to condemnation for all men, so one act of righteousness leads to 
justification and life for all men. For as by the one man’s disobedience the many were made sinners, so 
by the one man’s obedience the many will be made righteous. Now the law came in to increase the 
trespass, but where sin increased, grace abounded all the more, so that, as sin reigned in death, grace 
also might reign through righteousness leading to eternal life through Jesus Christ our Lord. 

Romans 6:23  

For the wages of sin is death, but the free gift of God is eternal life in Christ Jesus our Lord. 

Romans 3:23-25 

 for all have sinned and fall short of the glory of God, and are justified by his grace as a gift, through the 
redemption that is in Christ Jesus, whom God put forward as a propitiation by his blood, to be received by 
faith. 

2 Timothy 2:11-12  

The saying is trustworthy, for: If we have died with him, we will also live with him; if we endure, we will also 
reign with him; 

Revelation 21:1-4  

Then I saw a new heaven and a new earth, for the first heaven and the first earth had passed away, and 
the sea was no more.  And I saw the holy city, new Jerusalem, coming down out of heaven from God, 
prepared as a bride adorned for her husband.  And I heard a loud voice from the throne saying, “Behold, 
the dwelling place of God is with man. He will dwell with them, and they will be his people, and God 
himself will be with them as their God. He will wipe away every tear from their eyes, and death shall be no 
more, neither shall there be mourning, nor crying, nor pain anymore, for the former things have passed 
away.” 

1 Thessalonians 4:13-18  

But we do not want you to be uninformed, brothers, about those who are asleep, that you may not grieve 
as others do who have no hope.  For since we believe that Jesus died and rose again, even so, through 
Jesus, God will bring with him those who have fallen asleep. For this we declare to you by a word from the 
Lord, that we who are alive, who are left until the coming of the Lord, will not precede those who have 
fallen asleep. For the Lord himself will descend from heaven with a cry of command, with the voice of an 
archangel, and with the sound of the trumpet of God. And the dead in Christ will rise first.  Then we who 
are alive, who are left, will be caught up together with them in the clouds to meet the Lord in the air, and 
so we will always be with the Lord. therefore encourage one another with these words. 

Philippians 1:18-21  

Yes, and I will rejoice, for I know that through your prayers and the help of the Spirit of Jesus Christ this 
will turn out for my deliverance, as it is my eager expectation and hope that I will not be at all ashamed, 
but that with full courage now as always Christ will be honored in my body, whether by life or by death. 
For to me to live is Christ, and to die is gain. 


