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2 Kings 3 ESV

In the eighteenth year of 
Jehoshaphat king of Judah, Jehoram 
the son of Ahab became king over 
Israel in Samaria, and he reigned 
twelve years. He did what was evil 
in the sight of the LORD, though 
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not like his father and mother, for he 
put away the...

In the eighteenth year of 
Jehoshaphat king of Judah, Jehoram 
the son of Ahab became king over 
Israel in Samaria, and he reigned 
twelve years. He did what was evil 
in the sight of the LORD, though 
not like his father and mother, for he 
put away the...
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And he went and sent word to 
Jehoshaphat king of Judah: “The 
king of Moab has rebelled against 
me. Will you go with me to battle 
against Moab?” And he said, “I will 
go. I am as you are, my people as 
your people, my horses as your 
horses.”

So the king of Israel went with the 
king of Judah and the king of Edom. 
And when they had made a 
circuitous march of seven days, 
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there was no water for the army or 
for the animals that followed them.

Then the king of Israel said, “Alas! 
The LORD has called these three 
kings to give them into the hand of 
Moab.”

And Jehoshaphat said, “Is there no 
prophet of the LORD here, through 
whom we may inquire of the 
LORD?” Then one of the king of 
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Israel’s servants answered, “Elisha 
the son of Shaphat is here, who 
poured water on the hands of 
Elijah.” And Jehoshaphat...

And Elisha said to the king of 
Israel, “What have I to do with you? 
Go to the prophets of your father 
and to the prophets of your mother.” 
But the king of Israel said to him, 
“No; it is the LORD who has called 
these three kings to give them into 
the...
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And Elisha said, “As the LORD of 
hosts lives, before whom I stand, 
were it not that I have regard for 
Jehoshaphat the king of Judah, I 
would neither look at you nor see 
you.

And he took up the cloak of Elijah 
that had fallen from him and went 
back and stood on the bank of the 
Jordan. Then he took the cloak of 
Elijah that had fallen from him and 
struck the water, saying, “Where is 
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the LORD, the God of Elijah?” And 
when he...

Blessed be the God and Father of 
our Lord Jesus Christ, who has 
blessed us in Christ with every 
spiritual blessing in the heavenly 
places,

And he said, “Thus says the LORD, 
‘I will make this dry streambed full 
of pools.’ For thus says the LORD, 
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‘You shall not see wind or rain, but 
that streambed shall be filled with 
water, so that you shall drink, you, 
your livestock, and your animals.’...

But when they came to the camp of 
Israel, the Israelites rose and struck 
the Moabites, till they fled before 
them. And they went forward, 
striking the Moabites as they went. 
And they overthrew the cities, and 
on every good piece of land every 
man...
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When the king of Moab saw that the 
battle was going against him, he 
took with him 700 swordsmen to 
break through, opposite the king of 
Edom, but they could not. Then he 
took his oldest son who was to reign 
in his place and offered him for a 
burnt...

No, I imply that what pagans 
sacrifice they offer to demons and 
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not to God. I do not want you to be 
participants with demons.

casting all your anxieties on him, 
because he cares for you.

Do not be like them, for your Father 
knows what you need before you 
ask him.



do not be anxious about anything, 
but in everything by prayer and 
supplication with thanksgiving let 
your requests be made known to 
God. And the peace of God, which 
surpasses all understanding, will 
guard your hearts and your minds in 
Christ Jesus.
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