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John the Baptist – A Witness to The Light 

John 1:6-8  
 

Who was John the Baptist? 
His miraculous Birth Announced and Spirit-filled even before his birth! (Luke 1:5-25) 

John was a Nazarite (Num. 6:1-21) 

John’s Childhood and Development 

Old Testament Prophecies about John the Baptist (Is. 40:3, Mal. 3:1) 

John’s preaching ministry (Luke 3:1-22) 

John’s Doubts (Matthew 11:2-6) 

John’s Death (Matthew 14:1-12) 

John was a witness to the Light (John 1:6-8) 

Light vs Darkness (John 3:19-21) 

Jesus is the light (John 8:12, 12:44-46) 

We are called to be salt and light (Matt. 5:13-16, Eph. 5:8) 

We are called to be witnesses to the True Light (Mark 16:15, 1 Pet. 2:9-10) 

Be a Witness 

What is the Gospel? 
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Cross References 

Luke 1:5-25 

5 In the days of Herod, king of Judea, there was a priest named Zechariah, of the division 
of Abijah. And he had a wife from the daughters of Aaron, and her name was Elizabeth. 6 
And they were both righteous before God, walking blamelessly in all the commandments 
and statutes of the Lord. 7 But they had no child, because Elizabeth was barren, and both 
were advanced in years. 8 Now while he was serving as priest before God when his 
division was on duty, 9 according to the custom of the priesthood, he was chosen by lot to 
enter the temple of the Lord and burn incense. 10 And the whole multitude of the people 
were praying outside at the hour of incense. 11 And there appeared to him an angel of the 
Lord standing on the right side of the altar of incense. 12 And Zechariah was troubled 
when he saw him, and fear fell upon him. 13 But the angel said to him, “Do not be afraid, 
Zechariah, for your prayer has been heard, and your wife Elizabeth will bear you a son, 
and you shall call his name John. 14 And you will have joy and gladness, and many will 
rejoice at his birth, 15 for he will be great before the Lord. And he must not drink wine or 
strong drink, and he will be filled with the Holy Spirit, even from his mother's womb. 16 
And he will turn many of the children of Israel to the Lord their God, 17 and he will go 
before him in the spirit and power of Elijah, to turn the hearts of the fathers to the children, 
and the disobedient to the wisdom of the just, to make ready for the Lord a people 
prepared.” 18 And Zechariah said to the angel, “How shall I know this? For I am an old 
man, and my wife is advanced in years.” 19 And the angel answered him, “I am Gabriel. I 
stand in the presence of God, and I was sent to speak to you and to bring you this good 
news. 20 And behold, you will be silent and unable to speak until the day that these things 
take place, because you did not believe my words, which will be fulfilled in their time.” 21 
And the people were waiting for Zechariah, and they were wondering at his delay in the 
temple. 22 And when he came out, he was unable to speak to them, and they realized that 
he had seen a vision in the temple. And he kept making signs to them and remained mute. 
23 And when his time of service was ended, he went to his home. 24 After these days his 
wife Elizabeth conceived, and for five months she kept herself hidden, saying, 25 “Thus the 
Lord has done for me in the days when he looked on me, to take away my reproach among 
people.” 

Numbers 6:1-21 

6 And the Lord spoke to Moses, saying, 2 “Speak to the people of Israel and say to them, 
When either a man or a woman makes a special vow, the vow of a Nazirite, to separate 
himself to the Lord, 3 he shall separate himself from wine and strong drink. He shall drink 
no vinegar made from wine or strong drink and shall not drink any juice of grapes or eat 
grapes, fresh or dried. 4 All the days of his separation he shall eat nothing that is produced 
by the grapevine, not even the seeds or the skins. 5 “All the days of his vow of separation, 
no razor shall touch his head. Until the time is completed for which he separates himself to 



 

3 
 

the Lord, he shall be holy. He shall let the locks of hair of his head grow long. 6 “All the 
days that he separates himself to the Lord he shall not go near a dead body. 7 Not even for 
his father or for his mother, for brother or sister, if they die, shall he make himself unclean, 
because his separation to God is on his head. 8 All the days of his separation he is holy to 
the Lord. 9 “And if any man dies very suddenly beside him and he defiles his consecrated 
head, then he shall shave his head on the day of his cleansing; on the seventh day he shall 
shave it. 10 On the eighth day he shall bring two turtledoves or two pigeons to the priest to 
the entrance of the tent of meeting, 11 and the priest shall offer one for a sin offering and 
the other for a burnt offering, and make atonement for him, because he sinned by reason of 
the dead body. And he shall consecrate his head that same day 12 and separate himself to 
the Lord for the days of his separation and bring a male lamb a year old for a guilt offering. 
But the previous period shall be void, because his separation was defiled. 13 “And this is 
the law for the Nazirite, when the time of his separation has been completed: he shall be 
brought to the entrance of the tent of meeting, 14 and he shall bring his gift to the Lord, 
one male lamb a year old without blemish for a burnt offering, and one ewe lamb a year 
old without blemish as a sin offering, and one ram without blemish as a peace offering, 15 
and a basket of unleavened bread, loaves of fine flour mixed with oil, and unleavened 
wafers smeared with oil, and their grain offering and their drink offerings. 16 And the priest 
shall bring them before the Lord and offer his sin offering and his burnt offering, 17 and he 
shall offer the ram as a sacrifice of peace offering to the Lord, with the basket of 
unleavened bread. The priest shall offer also its grain offering and its drink offering. 18 And 
the Nazirite shall shave his consecrated head at the entrance of the tent of meeting and 
shall take the hair from his consecrated head and put it on the fire that is under the sacrifice 
of the peace offering. 19 And the priest shall take the shoulder of the ram, when it is boiled, 
and one unleavened loaf out of the basket and one unleavened wafer, and shall put them 
on the hands of the Nazirite, after he has shaved the hair of his consecration, 20 and the 
priest shall wave them for a wave offering before the Lord. They are a holy portion for the 
priest, together with the breast that is waved and the thigh that is contributed. And after 
that the Nazirite may drink wine. 21 “This is the law of the Nazirite. But if he vows an 
offering to the Lord above his Nazirite vow, as he can afford, in exact accordance with the 
vow that he takes, then he shall do in addition to the law of the Nazirite.” 

Isaiah 40:3 

3 A voice cries: “In the wilderness prepare the way of the Lord; make straight in the desert 
a highway for our God. 

Malachi 3:1 

3 “Behold, I send my messenger, and he will prepare the way before me. And the Lord 
whom you seek will suddenly come to his temple; and the messenger of the covenant in 
whom you delight, behold, he is coming, says the Lord of hosts. 
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Luke 3:1-22 

3 In the fifteenth year of the reign of Tiberius Caesar, Pontius Pilate being governor of 
Judea, and Herod being tetrarch of Galilee, and his brother Philip tetrarch of the region of 
Ituraea and Trachonitis, and Lysanias tetrarch of Abilene, 2 during the high priesthood of 
Annas and Caiaphas, the word of God came to John the son of Zechariah in the 
wilderness. 3 And he went into all the region around the Jordan, proclaiming a baptism of 
repentance for the forgiveness of sins. 4 As it is written in the book of the words of Isaiah 
the prophet, “The voice of one crying in the wilderness: ‘Prepare the way of the Lord,      
make his paths straight. 5 Every valley shall be filled, and every mountain and hill shall be 
made low, and the crooked shall become straight, and the rough places shall become level 
ways, 6 and all flesh shall see the salvation of God.’” 7 He said therefore to the crowds that 
came out to be baptized by him, “You brood of vipers! Who warned you to flee from the 
wrath to come? 8 Bear fruits in keeping with repentance. And do not begin to say to 
yourselves, ‘We have Abraham as our father.’ For I tell you, God is able from these stones 
to raise up children for Abraham. 9 Even now the axe is laid to the root of the trees. Every 
tree therefore that does not bear good fruit is cut down and thrown into the fire.” 10 And 
the crowds asked him, “What then shall we do?” 11 And he answered them, “Whoever 
has two tunics is to share with him who has none, and whoever has food is to do likewise.” 
12 Tax collectors also came to be baptized and said to him, “Teacher, what shall we do?” 
13 And he said to them, “Collect no more than you are authorized to do.” 14 Soldiers also 
asked him, “And we, what shall we do?” And he said to them, “Do not extort money from 
anyone by threats or by false accusation, and be content with your wages.” 15 As the 
people were in expectation, and all were questioning in their hearts concerning John, 
whether he might be the Christ, 16 John answered them all, saying, “I baptize you with 
water, but he who is mightier than I is coming, the strap of whose sandals I am not worthy 
to untie. He will baptize you with the Holy Spirit and fire. 17 His winnowing fork is in his 
hand, to clear his threshing floor and to gather the wheat into his barn, but the chaff he will 
burn with unquenchable fire.” 18 So with many other exhortations he preached good news 
to the people. 19 But Herod the tetrarch, who had been reproved by him for Herodias, his 
brother's wife, and for all the evil things that Herod had done, 20 added this to them all, 
that he locked up John in prison. 21 Now when all the people were baptized, and when 
Jesus also had been baptized and was praying, the heavens were opened, 22 and the Holy 
Spirit descended on him in bodily form, like a dove; and a voice came from heaven, “You 
are my beloved Son; with you I am well pleased.” 

Matthew 11:2-6 

2 Now when John heard in prison about the deeds of the Christ, he sent word by his 
disciples 3 and said to him, “Are you the one who is to come, or shall we look for 
another?” 4 And Jesus answered them, “Go and tell John what you hear and see: 5 the 
blind receive their sight and the lame walk, lepers are cleansed and the deaf hear, and the 
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dead are raised up, and the poor have good news preached to them. 6 And blessed is the 
one who is not offended by me.” 

Matthew 14:1-12 

14 At that time Herod the tetrarch heard about the fame of Jesus, 2 and he said to his 
servants, “This is John the Baptist. He has been raised from the dead; that is why these 
miraculous powers are at work in him.” 3 For Herod had seized John and bound him and 
put him in prison for the sake of Herodias, his brother Philip's wife, 4 because John had 
been saying to him, “It is not lawful for you to have her.” 5 And though he wanted to put 
him to death, he feared the people, because they held him to be a prophet. 6 But when 
Herod's birthday came, the daughter of Herodias danced before the company and pleased 
Herod, 7 so that he promised with an oath to give her whatever she might ask. 8 Prompted 
by her mother, she said, “Give me the head of John the Baptist here on a platter.” 9 And 
the king was sorry, but because of his oaths and his guests he commanded it to be given. 10 
He sent and had John beheaded in the prison, 11 and his head was brought on a platter and 
given to the girl, and she brought it to her mother. 12 And his disciples came and took the 
body and buried it, and they went and told Jesus. 

John 1:6-8 

6 There was a man sent from God, whose name was John. 7 He came as a witness, to bear 
witness about the light, that all might believe through him. 8 He was not the light, but 
came to bear witness about the light. 

John 3:19-21 

19 And this is the judgment: the light has come into the world, and people loved the 
darkness rather than the light because their works were evil. 20 For everyone who does 
wicked things hates the light and does not come to the light, lest his works should be 
exposed. 21 But whoever does what is true comes to the light, so that it may be clearly seen 
that his works have been carried out in God.” 

John 8:12 

12 Again Jesus spoke to them, saying, “I am the light of the world. Whoever follows me 
will not walk in darkness, but will have the light of life.” 

John 12:44-46 

44 And Jesus cried out and said, “Whoever believes in me, believes not in me but in him 
who sent me. 45 And whoever sees me sees him who sent me. 46 I have come into the 
world as light, so that whoever believes in me may not remain in darkness. 
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Matthew 5:13-16 

13 “You are the salt of the earth, but if salt has lost its taste, how shall its saltiness be 
restored? It is no longer good for anything except to be thrown out and trampled under 
people's feet. 14 “You are the light of the world. A city set on a hill cannot be hidden. 15 
Nor do people light a lamp and put it under a basket, but on a stand, and it gives light to all 
in the house. 16 In the same way, let your light shine before others, so that they may see 
your good works and give glory to your Father who is in heaven. 

Ephesians 5:8 

8 for at one time you were darkness, but now you are light in the Lord. Walk as children of 
light 

Mark 16:15 

15 And he said to them, “Go into all the world and proclaim the gospel to the whole 
creation. 

1 Peter 2:9-10 

9 But you are a chosen race, a royal priesthood, a holy nation, a people for his own 
possession, that you may proclaim the excellencies of him who called you out of darkness 
into his marvelous light. 10 Once you were not a people, but now you are God's people; 
once you had not received mercy, but now you have received mercy. 
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